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About Robin Roberts
From the mailroom to the Board Room, 
Robin spent 40+ years in the banking 
industry, including starting a new bank in 
Minneapolis in the 1990s.

He started BrightPath Financial to educate 
and help people improve their financial 
position.

Leverage the experience of Robin and 
BrightPath Financial to learn about how we 
can improve your financial future together.
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YOUR PATH to a BRIGHTERBRIGHTER FUTURE

Market volatility has been extremely high 
the last few days. 

The VIX, which represents future market 
volatility reached a high of 55 today. 
Typically, that index is around 20. It ended 
today at 39; still very high.

The Dow and S&P 500 indexes have lost 
about 5% the past 5 days.  The Dow is still
up 2.6% this year, and the S&P 500 has 
gained 9.3% this year.

Expect even more market volatility in the 
weeks and months ahead. Act now to move 
your investments into safe alternatives 
avoiding additional losses.

My clients haven’t lost any money this 
month, and they won’t ever lose money 
in safe investments that participate in the 
upside of the market but will never lose 
money when the markets decline in value.

If you’d like to learn more, call/text me at 
612-867-5959, or send me an email. I’d be 
happy to review your investment plan with 
you. 
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